
The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, 
national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation.  Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO 

Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities 

(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

REVISED: 5/19/2017 

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

ITB #: FY20-097 Tentative Board Meeting Date*: SEPTEMBER 4, 2019 

ITB Title: Purchase/Repair of New/Used/Reconditioned Golf Cart # Notified: 93 # Downloaded:  10 

# of Responses Rec’d: 5 # of “No Bids”: 0 

For: District-wide RFP Opening Date : JULY 2, 2019 

(School/Department)

Fund: Department and Schools Operating Budges Advertised Date: JUNE 3, 2019 

POSTING OF Select One RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: Select One Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement 

& Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on __JULY 9, ________________@ 3:00 pm and will remain posted for 72 hours.  Any person 

who is adversely affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of 

decision or intended decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a 

notice of protest or failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, 

states that “The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.” Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays 

and days during which the District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the office of the 

Director of Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action 

protesting an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of 

Broward County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by 

SBBC Policy 3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest. 

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / HARD BID, is in effect until it is approved by SBBC.  The Board meeting 

date stated above is tentative.  Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.  

REVISED RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

ADVANTAGE GOLF CARS, INC. GROUP 1, ITEM 1,2,3 

GROUP 2, ITEM 3,4,5,6,7,9,10,12 

GROUP 3 

JEFFREY ALLEN, INC. GROUP 1, ITEM 2 

GROUP 2, ITEM 2, 8, 11 

NASREP INC., DBA BROWARD ELECTRIC CAR & 

      EQUIPMENT 

GROUP 1, ITEM 1 

GROUP 2, ITEM 1 

SOUTHERN GOLF CARS GROUP 1, ITEM 3, 

GROUP 2, ITEM 2,3,5,6,8,9,11,12 

GROUP 3 

GOLF CAR & UTILITY VEHICLE DISTRIBUTORS DBA 

     TROPICARS 

GROUP 2, ITEM 1,4,7,10 

GROUP 3 

CONTRACT TERM:  SEPTEMBER 5, 2019 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2022 

By: Date: JULY 9, 2019 

(Purchasing Agent) 
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Quantity

Unit of 

Measure Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

GROUP 1

Item 1

A 2 each 6,800.00$   13,600.00$   7,699.00$   15,398.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

B 5 each 7,300.00$   36,500.00$   8,199.00$   40,995.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

C 2 each 6,500.00$   13,000.00$   7,299.00$   14,598.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

D 5 each 7,000.00$   35,000.00$   7,799.00$   38,995.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

E 2 each 8,400.00$   16,800.00$   9,199.00$   18,398.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F 2 each 9,900.00$   19,800.00$   11,250.00$   22,500.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

G 2 each 8,100.00$   16,200.00$   8,699.00$   17,398.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

H 2 each 7,700.00$   15,400.00$   8,299.00$   16,598.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

I 2 each 9,700.00$   19,400.00$   10,599.00$   21,198.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 1 Total 185,700.00$   206,078.00$  

Item 2

A 2 each 7,500.00$   15,000.00$   No Bid No Bid 8,098.15$   16,196.30$   7,595.00$   15,190.00$   No Bid No Bid

B 2 each 8,300.00$   16,600.00$   No Bid No Bid 8,918.15$   17,836.30$   8,595.00$   17,190.00$   No Bid No Bid

C 5 each 10,400.00$   52,000.00$   No Bid No Bid 10,801.00$     54,005.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 2 Total 83,600.00$   88,037.60$  

Item 3

A 1 each 7,800.00$   7,800.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7,595.00$   7,595.00$     No Bid No Bid

B 2 each 8,400.00$   16,800.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8,595.00$   17,190.00$   No Bid No Bid

Item 3 Total 24,600.00$   24,785.00$  

GROUP 2

ITEM 1 10% 10% No Bid No Bid 20%

ITEM 2 10% 10% 20% 15% No Bid

ITEM 3 10% No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

ITEM 4 10% 5% No Bid No Bid 20%

ITEM 5 10% 5% No Bid 15% No Bid

ITEM 6 10% No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

ITEM 7 10% 10% No Bid No Bid 20%

ITEM 8 10% 10% 20% 15% No Bid

ITEM 9 10% No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

ITEM 10 10% 5% No Bid No Bid 20%

ITEM 11 10% 5% 20% 15% No Bid

ITEM 12 10% No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid

GROUP 3

Hourly Rate 1000 hours 60.00$   60,000.00$   90.00$   90,000.00$   100.00$   100,000.00$   75.00$   75,000.00$   65.00$  65,000.00$   

Onsite Service Call 50 each 50.00$   2,500.00$   60.00$   3,000.00$   84.00$   4,200.00$   45.00$   2,250.00$     65.00$  3,250.00$   

Pick-up Delivery Fee 50 each 50.00$   2,500.00$   90.00$   4,500.00$   50.00$   2,500.00$   55.00$   2,750.00$     100.00$  5,000.00$   

Vehcle Daily Rental Rate 10 each 50.00$   500.00$   50.00$   500.00$   288.00$   2,880.00$   50.00$   500.00$   150.00$  1,500.00$   

Total Group 3 65,500.00$   98,000.00$   109,580.00$   80,500.00$  74,750.00$   

Golf Car & Utility Vehicle 

Distributors DBA, 

Tropicars

Advantage Golf Cars, 

Inc

Nasrep Inc. d/b/a 

Broward Electric Car & 

Equipment
Jeffrey Allen, Inc. Southern Golf Cars
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